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DESCRIPTION
STATUS/REMARKS, ACCOMPLISHMENT

LINGAP 
CENTER

SOCIAL SERVICES

 Admitted cases of children:

CATEGORY M F Total
Neglected 5 6 11
Maltreated 1 2 3
Street child 1 2 3

17

 Individual updates/ recordings of case folders.

 SWO  I  Vergara  conducted  one  (1)  virtual  Case 
Conference with the adoptive mother of 1 client 
from Cordon, Isabela on January 13, 2025

 Admission Case Conference of 1 client from City of 
Ilagan, Isabela was led by OIC Batoon and SWO I 
Vergara, with the minors’ mother, the barangay 
secretary and CSWDO, on January 20, 2025.

 Monthly  staff meeting was held  on January  27, 
2025, led by OIC Batoon, focusing on the children’s 
educational, behavioral and social functioning, as 
well  as  the  upcoming  culmination  of  the 
Valentine’s Party. The OIC also reminded the staff 
of  their  duties  in  accordance  with  the  Child 
Protection Policy.

 Regular facilitation of endorsement and discussion 
of Houseparents with regard to their observations 
and activities  undertaken with  the  children and 
their overall concerns led by OIC Batoon and SWO I 
Vergara.

HOMELIFE 
SERVICES Provision of food, clothing, toiletries, personal care, to 

wit:

Food ₱49,048.00
Groceries ₱12,547.00
Non - Food ₱3,165.00
Haircut ₱1,020.00
Total ₱114,828.00

 Homelife meeting with the children was facilitated 
by HP Cauilan and HP Atraje on January 08, 2025.



 Daily  facilitation  of  homelife  activities  (i.e., 
household chores, self-care, etc.) and safety of all 
residents as supervised by the Houseparents on-
duty.

EDUCATIONAL 
SERVICES

 Currently,  14  residents  are  enrolled  at  Alibagu 
Elementary  School  (AES).  This  includes  two  (2) 
residents in Grades 5 and 6, three (3) in Grade 4, 
two (2) in Grade 3, three (3) in Grade 2, and two (2) 
in kindergarten.

 At  present,  three  (3)  residents  are  enrolled  in 
Alibagu National High School (ANHS). Specifically, 
there is one resident each in Grades 7, 9, and 10.

 Attendance of HP Vicente during the PTCA meeting 
and  2nd Quarter  awarding  and  distribution  of 
Report Cards at AES on January 10, 2025.

 Two  residents  were  awarded  with  Academic 
Excellence  (With  Honors)  for  the  2nd quarter  of 
school  Year  2024  –  2025.  Additionally,  the 
kindergartens received Character Traits Award in 
recognition of their positive behaviors. 

 On January 15, 2025, OIC Batoon coordinated with 
Principal  Estrellon  of  AES  and  Head  Teacher 
Teodoro  of  ANHS  regarding  the  residents  who 
were  reintegrated  into  their  families  and 
transferred to schools close to their homes.

MEDICAL/ 
HEALTH SERVICES

 Regular intake of Vitamin C and Multivitamins by 
residents

 Continuous  weighing  and  height  measuring  to 
determine the BMI of children –  seventeen (17) 
children are Normal and one (1) is Overweight.

 Emergency checkup and confinement of one (1) 
client  experiencing  severe  stomachache  at  the 
GFNDy  Memorial  Hospital,  accompanied  by  HP 
Atraje, with the coordination of DART Isabela, on 
January 02, 2025. 

 Two (2) clients were brought to GFNDy Memorial 

Grade Level M F Total
Junior High School 1 2 3
Elementary 6 8 14

   Total:           17 

School & Transportation Allowance ₱20,900.00

School Project ₱40.00

Total ₱20,940.00



Hospital for Anti-Tetanus shot and Dental checkup, 
accompanied by Nurse Calabazaron on January 03, 
2025.

 Two clients were brought to the same hospital for 
checkup due to cough and colds, and at the same 
time,  first  anti-rabies  vaccine  shot  was 
administered to  one (1)  client,  accompanied by 
Nurse Calabazaron on January 18, 2025.

 Tooth extraction of a client at the same hospital, 
accompanied by Nurse Calabazaron on January 21, 
2025.

 Medical checkup of newly admitted client due to 
cough and fever, and 2nd dose of Anti-Rabies shot 
was administered to a client, accompanied by the 
center nurse and HP Vicente.

 Third  dose  of  Anti-Rabies  vaccine  was 
administered  to  a  client,  accompanied  by  the 
nurse. 

 Close  monitoring  to  residents  who  had  fever, 
coughs,  colds  and  toothache  while  regular 
supervision of HP on their medical intake.

 Regular reminders on drinking a lot of water/fluid 
to relieve heat stress and prevention from coughs 
and colds

Provision of medicines and transportation expenses, to 
wit:

PSYCHOLOGICAL 
SERVICES

 Individual counseling to two (2) clients undergoing 
crisis and stress, was provided by Psychometrician 
Villanueva on January 6 & 9, 2025.

 Group play activities were conducted for sixteen 
(16) residents to foster positive peer relationships, 
done by Psychometrician Villanueva,  on January 
18, 2025.

 Draw-a-Person Test was administered to one (1) 
client  by  Psychometrician  Villanueva  with  the 
permission of Psychologist Salmos to gain insight 
into his inner thoughts and feelings, on January 30, 
2025.

SPIRITUAL 
ENHANCEMENT 

AND VALUES 
INCULCATION

 Regular Sunday Worship being conducted by HP/ 
Pastor Mario Valdez

 Teaching residents to pray spontaneously

 Inculcation  of  values  by  staff  and  emphasis  on 
positive  attitude  at  all  times  most  especially 

Medical Needs ₱2,102.50

Transportation going to 
hospital for medical check-up

₱560.00

Total ₱2,662.5



towards residents and other people

RECREATIONAL, 
SPORTS AND 

SOCIO – 
CULTURAL 
SERVICES

 Regular Zumba at 7:00 - 8:00 AM during weekends

 Facilitation  of  indoor  and  outdoor  games  daily, 
4:00 - 5:00 PM

 Recreational  activities  and  other  special  events 
extended  by  donors/benefactors  on  different 
dates.

 All  Lingap  Center  residents,  together  with  OIC 
Batoon, SWO I Vergara and HPs on-duty, witnessed 
the grand finals of Isabela’s Got Talent and Grand 
Fireworks  Display  at  the  Queen  Isabela  Park, 
Alibagu, Isabela on January 19, 2025.

 All  Lingap residents,  accompanied by HP Valdez 
and HP Vicente, visited the Bambanti Village at the 
Provincial  Capitol  Grounds  to  see  the  giant 
scarecrows,  booths,  and  artistic  decorations  on 
January 22, 2025.

TRAININGS AND 
OTHER 

ACTIVITIES

 Attendance of Lingap personnel during the Holy 
Mass for the visit of the pilgrim image of Our Lady 
of the Rosary of Manaoag at the Amphitheater, 
Provincial  Capitol,  City  of  Ilagan,  Isabela,  on 
January 06, 2025.

 Psychometrician  Villanueva  and  AA  III  Camaso 
were selected and served as part of the reception 
committee (usher and usherette) for the Bambanti 
Festival 2025 held from January 19 – 25, 2025.

 Lingap Center staff attended the Holy Mass for the 
opening  of  the  Bambanti  Festival  2025  at  St. 
Michael Cathedral, Upi, Gamu, Isabela, on January 
19, 2025.

 Active participation of all center staff during the 3K 
Color Fun Run held in the vicinity of the Provincial 
Government of Isabela and Queen Isabela Park on 
January 19, 2025.
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